DIBBS Batch File Format
Upload File Format 
File format: Comma ( , ) Delimited with quote ( " ) separator. 
Example: "SPE1C114T2120","F","N","N","10/02/2014","","","","","","","","","","","","","","","","","","","BI"........ 
File layout: Upload file is basically in the same order, as the data would display on the individual web quote form. 

Unacceptable Characters 
Upon importing your data into our system, the following characters shall be stripped from your input with the exception as noted in note 2 & 3. 
    ,'~`!@#$%^&*;{}[]|\+=?;<> '     ASCII Characters 0~32 and greater than 126 

Note: 
1. Commas are used for data separation and should not be included in your response data with the exception as noted in note 2 & 3. 

2. The following characters ARE allowed for part number field. 
0123456789
ABCDEFGHIJKLMNOPQRSTUVWXYZ
~!@#$%)(_-+=}{[]\:;'",.?/ & * space 


(108) Part Number Offered 

3. The following characters ARE allowed for remarks fields. 
ABCDEFGHIJKLMNOPQRSTUVWXYZ
0123456789
~!@#$%)(_-+=}{[]\:;'",.?/ space 


(109) Part Number Offered Remarks 
(111) Supplies Offered Remarks 
(119) Higher-Level Quality Remarks 
(121) Quote Remarks

Quote Level 
	Header 
	Cols 1-43 , 121 
	Must be the same for each line for the individual quote. 

	Line 
	Cols 44, 46-51, 64 
	May vary by line 

	Subline 
	Col 45 
	May vary by subline. 

	Product 
	Cols 65-120 
	Must be the same data for each NSN/PN across all lines. 



Data Content 
Input Code Legend
	M 
	Mandatory Entry 

	C 
	Required when applicable 

	0 
	Optional 




Last Updated: 10/25/2016     Release: 5.1 
	# 
	Quote Level 
	Column Name 
	Maximum Length 
	Input Code 
	DEFINITION 
	VALIDATION 
	DEFAULT 

	1 
	Header 
	Solicitation Number 
	13 
	M 
	  
	Must Match RFQ Requirement 
	RFQ Solicitation # 

	2 
	Header 
	Solicitation Type Indicator 
	1 
	C 
	Type of RFQ requirement. 
	Must Match RFQ Requirement (may be blank)
Valid Codes:
A - Auction
F - FAST AWARD Candidate
P - PACE Candidate 
	RFQ Requirement 

	3 
	Header 
	Small Business Set-Aside Indicator 
	1 
	M 
	Indicates if the RFQ is a Small Business Set-Aside. 
	Must Match RFQ Requirement
Valid Codes:
Y - Set-Aside
C - Combined Set-Aside
H - Hubzone Set-Aside
V - Very Small Business Set-Aside
R - SDVOSB
W - Set-Aside Withdrawn
N - Not Set-Aside 
	RFQ Requirement 

	4 
	Header 
	Additional Clause Fill-Ins Indicator 
	1 
	M 
	Indicates if additional "Clause Fill Ins" are required. 
	Must Match RFQ Requirement
Valid Codes:
Y - Yes
N - No 
	RFQ Requirement 

	5 
	Header 
	Return By Date 
	10 
	M 
	Provided for informational purposes only. 
	Must Match RFQ Requirement
Format MM/DD/YYYY 
	RFQ Return By Date 

	6 
	Header 
	Quoter CAGE 
	5 
	M 
	CAGE that submits the quote. 
	Must match registered CAGE. 
	Blank 

	7 
	Header 
	Quoting For CAGE code 
	5 
	M 
	CAGE for whom the quote is submitted. 
	Must Match Registered CAGE and, if different than the Quoter CAGE,must have provided authorization for the "Quoter CAGE" to submit quotes on their behalf. 
	Blank 

	8 
	RESERVED 

	9 
	RESERVED 

	10 
	RESERVED 

	11 
	RESERVED 

	12 
	RESERVED 

	13 
	Header 
	Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Code 
	1 
	M 
	Applies to Quote For CAGE code. 
	Valid Codes:
A - Large Business/Other Business
B - Small Business Concern
M - Small Disadvantaged Business Concern
C - Nonprofit Institution
F - Historically Black College or University (HBCU)
P - Minority Institution
E - Other Educational (Other than HBCU)
G - JWOD Participating Nonprofit Agency
X - Intragovernmental 
	Blank 

	14 
	Header 
	Small Disadvantaged Business Ethnic Type Code 
	1 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote For CAGE is a small disadvantaged business concern. Select category in which ownership falls. 
	If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) does not equal M then must be blank.

If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) equals M must be completed.

Valid Codes:
A - Asian-Indian American
B - Asian-Pacific American
C - Black American
D - Hispanic American
E - Native American
F - Other SDB Certified or Determined by SBA 
	Blank 

	15 
	Header 
	Woman-Owned Small Business 
	1 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote For CAGE is a small business concern. Is the Quote For CAGE a woman owned small business? 
	If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) does not equal B or M then must be blank.

If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) equals B or M must be completed.

Valid Codes:
W - Yes
N - No 
	Blank 

	16 
	Header 
	Veteran-Owned Small Business 
	1 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote For CAGE is a small business concern. Is the Quote For CAGE a veteran owned small business concern? 
	If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) does not equal B or M then must be blank.

If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) equals B or M may be completed.

Valid Codes:
R - Service Disabled Veteran-Owned Small Business
T - Other Vetern Owned Small Business 
	Blank 

	17 
	Header 
	HUBZone Small Business 
	1 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote for CAGE is a small business concern. Is the Quote For CAGE a HUBZone small business concern? 
	If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) does not equal B or M then must be blank.

If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) equals B or M must be completed. Valid codes: (Y and N)

If small business concern does not appear on the List of Qualified HUBZone Small Business Concerns
maintained by the Small Business Administration, then must be N.

Valid Codes:
Y - Yes
N - No 
	Blank 

	18 
	Header 
	HUBZone Joint Venture 
	2 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote For CAGE is a small business concern. Is the Quote For CAGE a HUBZone Joint Venture? 
	If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) does not equal B or M then must be blank.

If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) = B or M then may be completed.

If HUBZone Small Business (17) equals N, then must be blank.

Valid Codes:
JV - Joint Venture that complies with 13 CFR Part 26
JN - Is not a Joint Venture that complies with 13 CFR Part 26 
	Blank 

	19 
	Header 
	Participating HUBZone small-business concern(s) Remarks 
	255 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote For CAGE is a HUBZone Joint Venture. Insert the CAGE(s)/Names(s) of the HUBZone Small Business Concern or Concerns that are participating in the Joint Venture. 
	If HUBZone Joint Venture (18) does not equal JV, then must be blank.

If HUBZone Joint Venture (18) equals JV, then must be completed. 
	Blank 

	20 
	Header 
	Very Small Business 
	1 
	C 
	Applicable where Quote For CAGE code is a small business concern.

Is the Quote For CAGE code a very small business concern in the SBA Region 5 - Columbus, OH (less than or equal to 15 employees;avg. annual receipts do not exceed $1 MIL; and HQ in OH county listed in FAR 19.902(5)). NOTE: Solicitation Number's 4th position equals 7 or 9.

Is the Quote For CAGE code a very small business concern in the SBA Region 3 - Philadelphia, PA (less than or equal to 15 employees;avg. annual receipts do not
exceed $1 MIL; and HQ in DE, PA county listed in FAR 19.902(5)). NOTE: Solicitation Number's 4th position equals 4 
	If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) does not equal B or M then must be blank.

If Small Business and Other Contractor Representations Codes (13) = B or M then may be completed.

Valid Codes:
5 - Headquartered within Columbus, OH SBA Region
3 - Headquartered within Philadelphia, PA SBA Region 
	Blank 

	21 
	Header 
	Affirmative Action Compliance Code 
	2 
	M 
	Applies to Quote For CAGE code. 
	Valid Codes:
N6 - Not Developed and Not on File
NA - Not Applicable
NH - No Previous Contracts Subject To Requirements
Y6 - Developed and On File 
	Blank 

	22 
	Header 
	Previous Contracts and Compliance Reports Code 
	2 
	M 
	Applies to Quote For CAGE code. 
	Valid Codes:
N4 - Not Participated
NA - Not Applicable
Y4 - Participated and Filed
Y5 - Participated and Not Filed 
	Blank 

	23 
	Header 
	Alternate Disputes Resolution 
	1 
	M 
	Do you agree to use alternate dispute resolution in accordance with DLAD 52.233 - 9001? 
	Valid Codes:
A - Agree to use Alternate Disputes Resolution
B - Do not Agree to use Alternate Disputes Resolution 
	Blank 

	24 
	Header 
	Bid Type Code 
	2 
	M 
	  
	Valid Codes:
AB - Alternate Bid
BI - Bid Without Exception
BW - Bid With Exception
DQ - No Bid 
	BI 

	25 
	Header 
	Prompt Payment Discount Terms Code 
	2 
	M 
	  
	Valid Codes:
1 - Net 30
10 - 2 % 10 Days
3 - 1/2 % 20 Days
6 - 1/2 % 10 Days
8 - 1/4 % 20 Days
15 - Net 10 Days 
	1 

	26 
	Header 
	Vendor Quote Number 
	15 
	O 
	Optional Fill-In for vendor reference only. 
	  
	Blank 

	27 
	Header 
	Days Quote Valid 
	3 
	M 
	Enter Number Of Days Your Quote Is Valid. 
	  
	90 

	28 
	Header 
	Meets Packaging and RFID Requirements? 
	1 
	M 
	  
	Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes

If “N” response then Bid Type code (24) must be Bid With Exception, “BW” or Alternate Bid, “AB”.
	Blank 

	29 
	Header 
	Basic Ordering Agreement (BOA)/ Federal Supply Schedule (FSS)/Blanket Purchase Agreement (BPA). 
	3 
	M 
	  
	Valid Codes:
NAP - Not Applicable
BOA - Blanket Ordering Agreement
FSS - Federal Supply Schedule
BPA - Blanket Purchase Agreement

If BOA/FSS/BPA (29) is "BOA", "FSS" or "BPA", Contract # (30) and Expiration date (31) must be completed.

If BOA/FSS/BPA (29) is "NAP", BOA/FSS/or BPA Contract # (30) and Expiration date (31) must be blank. 
	NAP 

	30 
	Header 
	BOA/FSS/BPA Contract Number 
	17 
	C 
	  
	If BOA/FSS/or BPA (29), = "BOA", "FSS" or "BPA", required.

If BOA/FSS/BPA (29), = "NAP", BOA/FSS/or BPA Contract Number (30) must be blank. 
	Blank 

	31 
	Header 
	BOA/FSS/BPA Contract Expiration Date 
	10 
	C 
	  
	If BOA/FSS/BPA (29), = "BOA", "FSS" or "BPA", required. Format MM/DD/YYYY

If BOA/FSS/BPA (29), = "NAP", BOA/FSS/ or BPA Contract Expiration date (31) must be blank. 
	Blank 

	32 
	Header 
	FOB Point 
	1 
	M 
	  
	Valid Codes:
D - Destination
O - Origin

If not in accordance with RFQ requirement, then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB".

If "O" response, City (33), State/Province (34) and Country (35) are required. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	33 
	Header 
	FOB City 
	30 
	C 
	  
	If FOB Point (32), = "D", must be blank.

If "O" response, City (33), State/Province (34) and Country (35) are required. 
	Blank 

	34 
	Header 
	FOB State/Province 
	2 
	C 
	  
	If FOB Point (32) = "D", must be blank.

If FOB Point (32) = "O" response, City (33), State/Province (34) and Country (35) are required.

Valid Codes:
United States Codes: See State Codes Attachment.
Canadian Province Codes: See Canadian Province Attachment. 
	Blank 

	35 
	Header 
	FOB Country 
	2 
	C 
	  
	If FOB Point (32) = "D", must be blank.

If FOB Point (32) = "O" response, City (33), State/Province (34) and Country (35) are required.

Valid Codes: See Country Code Attachment . 
	Blank 

	36 
	Header 
	Inspection Point Code 
	1 
	M 
	  
	Valid Codes:
D - Destination
O - Origin

If RFQ requirement is origin and Inspection Point Code (36) is "D", Bid Type Code (24) must equal bid with exception "BW" or alternate bid "AB".
	RFQ Requirement 

	37 
	Header 
	Place of Government Inspection - Packaging CAGE code 
	5 
	C 
	  
	If Inspection Point Code (36), = "O", required.

If Inspection Point Code (36), = "D", must be blank 
	Blank 

	38 
	Header 
	Place of Government Inspection - Supplies CAGE code 
	5 
	C 
	  
	If Inspection Point Code (36), = "O", required.

If Inspection Point Code (36), = "D", must be blank. 
	Blank 

	39 
	Header 
	Substitutions for Military or Federal Specifications and Standards (SPI) Process Proposed 
	1 
	C 
	Are you proposing to use a previously accepted SPI Process? 
	Applies when Total Quote value is equal to or greater than the micropurchase threshold.

Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes 
	N 

	40 
	Header 
	SPI Process 
	60 
	O 
	  
	Applies only if SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "Y".

If SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "N", must be blank. 
	Blank 

	41 
	Header 
	SPI Facility 
	60 
	O 
	  
	Applies only if SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "Y".

If SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "N", must be blank. 
	Blank 

	42 
	Header 
	SPI Military or Federal Specification or Standard 
	60 
	O 
	  
	Applies only if SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "Y".

if SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "N", must be blank. 
	Blank 

	43 
	Header 
	SPI Affected Contract Line Item Number, Subline Item Number, Component, or Element 
	60 
	O 
	  
	Applies only if SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "Y".

if SPI Process Proposed (39) equals "N", must be blank. 
	Blank 

	44 
	Line 
	Solicitation Line Number 
	4 
	M 
	Description: 0000 - 9999 
	Must match Solicitation Line for Solicitation Line listed on RFQ. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	45 
	RESERVED 
	RESERVED 
	  
	  
	RESERVED 
	RESERVED 
	RESERVED 

	46 
	Line 
	Purchase Request Number 
	10 
	M 
	  
	Must match Purchase Request Number for Solicitation Line listed on RFQ. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	47 
	Line 
	National Stock Number / Part Number 
	15 
	M 
	  
	Must match NSN/Part Number listed for Solicitation Line listed on RFQ. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	48 
	Line 
	Unit of Issue 
	2 
	M 
	  
	Must match Unit of Issue listed for Solicitation Line listed on RFQ. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	49 
	Line 
	Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	  
	If not in accordance with RFQ requirement, then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB".

If zero quantity (49) for all line items, Bid Type Code (24) must equal "DQ" No Bid.

Offering a different quantity than solicited on National Stock Number / Part Number (15) 0001S00000052 or 0001S00000053 is prohibited. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	50 
	Line 
	Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If "No Charge", "Free Issue" or "No Bid" on a line item enter 0

	Unit Price must be a number from .00000 to 9999999.99999 having (0 ~ 5 decimal places).

Cannot be Blank. 
	Blank 

	51 
	Line 
	Delivery Days 
	4* 
	C 
	Delivery days after date of order (ADO). 
	Cannot be Blank. 

Format 0 ~ 9999

* NOTE: If the solicitation number (1) begins with "SPM", the valid length is 3. 

If zero unit price (50) entered and delivery days (51) does not equal zero, Government assumes no charge.

If zero unit price (50) and zero delivery days (51):
Government assumes no bid on the line item, unless the National Stock Number / Part Number (15) is 0001S00000052 or 0001S00000053, then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB".

If the National Stock Number / Part Number (15) is 0001S00000052 or 0001S00000053, Government assumes "Request Waiver of First Article Testing (FAT)" unless First Article Waiver Code (64) = "N". If First Article Waiver Code (64) = "N", delivery days cannot equal zero. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	52 
	RESERVED 

	53 
	RESERVED 

	54 
	RESERVED 

	55 
	RESERVED 

	56 
	RESERVED 

	57 
	RESERVED 

	58 
	RESERVED 

	59
	Product
	Immediate Shipment Price
	13
	C
	Provide price of the item that is available for immediate shipment.
	If Immediate Shipment Available (100) equals "N", then must be blank.

If Immediate Shipment Available (100) equals "Y", then cannot be blank.

Price must be a number from .00000 to 9999999.99999 having 0 ~ 5 decimal places.
	Blank

	60
	Product
	Immediate Shipment Delivery Days
	4
	C
	Provide delivery days of the item that is available for immediate shipment.
	If Immediate Shipment Available (100) equals "N", then must be blank.

If Immediate Shipment Available (100) equals "Y", then cannot be blank.

Format 0 ~ 9999
	Blank

	61
	
	RESERVED
	
	
	RESERVED
	RESERVED
	

	62
	
	RESERVED
	
	
	RESERVED
	RESERVED
	

	63
	Product 
	Source of Supply CAGE Code
	5 
	C 
	Required if “Qualified Supplier List Dealer” is selected in Manufacturer/ Dealer (field 102).  Must be blank if “Qualified Supplier List Dealer” is not selected in Manufacturer/Dealer (field 102). 
	Must be a valid, five position CAGE Code.

	Blank

	64 
	Line 
	First Article Waiver Code 
	1 
	C 
	Request Waiver of First Article Testing? 
	Applicable to National Stock Number / Part Number (15) is 0001S00000052 or 0001S00000053.

Valid Codes:
Y - Yes. Request wavier.
N - No wavier requested.

If National Stock Number / Part Number (15) is NOT 0001S00000052 or 0001S00000053, must be blank. 
	Blank 

	65 
	Product 
	Hazardous Material Identification and Material Safety Data 
	1 
	M 
	Identify hazardous material to be delivered under any resultant contract as prescribed by FAR 52.223 - 3. 
	Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes 
	Blank 

	66 
	Product 
	Hazardous Warning Label 
	1 
	C 
	  
	If Hazardous Material Identification and Material Safety Data (65) equals "Y", requires choice of statute to which the hazardous warning label will conform as prescribed by DFARS 252.223 - 7001.

Valid Codes:
1 - Hazardous Communication Standard
2 - Federal Insecticide, Fungicide and Rodenticide Act
3 - Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act
4 - Consumer Product Safety Act
5 - Federal Hazardous Substance Act
6 - Federal Alcohol Administration Act 
7 - Not Applicable
	Blank 

	67 
	Product 
	Material Requirements Type Code 
	1 
	M 
	Identify new, used, reconditioned, or remanufactured supplies, or former Government surplus property proposed for use under any resultant contract as prescribed by FAR 52.211 - 5. 
	Valid Codes:
0 - New
1 - Other than New (Used)
2 - Reconditioned
3 - Remanufactured
4 - New/Unused Government Surplus 
	Blank 

	68 
	Product 
	Buy American Indicator 
	1 
	M 
	Applies unless Buy American Act/ Free Trade Agreements - Balance of Payments Program is included in the solicitation. 
	Must Match RFQ Requirement.

Valid Codes:
N - Not Applicable
Y - Applicable RFQ requirement
I - Information Only (Overseas Shipment) 
	RFQ Requirement 

	69 
	Product 
	Free Trade Agreements Indicator 
	1 
	M 
	Applies only if "Buy American Act/ Free Trade Agreements - Balance of Payments Program", is included in solicitation. 
	Must Match RFQ Requirement.

Valid Codes:
N - Not Applicable
Y - Free Trade Agreements
A - Free Trade Agreements ALT 1 
B – Free Trade Agreements ALT IV
I - Information Only (Overseas Shipment)
	RFQ Requirement 

	70 
	Product 
	Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product 
	2 
	M 
	Buy American Act/Free Trade Agreements (DFARS 252.225-7000 & DFARS 252.225-7035): For Quotes equal or less than the micro-purchase threshold and Supplies Acquired for use Outside the United States this fill-in is gathered for information purposes only as the restrictions of the Buy American Act do not apply. 
	If Buy American Indicator (68) = "N" and Free Trade Agreements Indicator (69) = "N",
Valid Codes:
D - Domestic End Product
Q - Qualifying Country End Product
NQ - Non-Qualifying Country End Product

If Buy American Indicator (68) = "Y" or "I",
Valid Codes:
D - Domestic End Product
Q - Qualifying Country End Product
NQ - Non-Qualifying Country End Product

If Free Trade Agreements Indicator (69) = "Y",
Valid Codes:
D - Domestic
N - Free Trade Agreement Country End Products (Australia, Canada, Chile, Columbia, Costa Rica, Dominican Republic, El Salvador, Guatemala, Honduras, Republic of Korea, Mexico, Nicaragua, Singapore)
QA - Qualifying Country (EXCEPT CANADA and AUSTRALIA) End Product
O - Other Foreign End Products

If Free Trade Agreements Indicator (69) = "A",
Valid Codes:
D - Domestic
C - Canadian End Product
QE - Qualifying Country (EXCEPT CANADA) End Product
O - Other Foreign End Products 

If Free Trade Agreements Indicator (69) = "B",
Valid Codes:
D – Domestic
P - Free Trade Agreement Country End Products (Australia, Canada, Chile, Columbia, Costa Rica, Dominican Republic, El Salvador, Guatemala, Honduras, Mexico, Nicaragua, Singapore)
QA - Qualifying Country (EXCEPT CANADA and AUSTRALIA) End Product
O - Other Foreign End Products 
	Blank 

	71 
	Product 
	Buy American / Free Trade Agreements Country of Origin 
	25 
	C 
	Applies when supplying a non-qualifying country end product or other foreign end product. 
	If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) does not equal "NQ" or "O", must be blank.

If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) = "NQ" or "O", enter country of origin if known. 
	Blank 

	72 
	Product 
	Buy American / Free Trade Agreements Country Code 
	2 
	M 
	Applies when supplying a qualifying or Free Trade Agreements country end product. 
	If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) = "D", "NQ", or "O" must be Blank. If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) = Q enter a Qualified Country End Product.
Valid Codes:
AU - Australia
AT - Austria
BE - Belgium
CA – Canada
CZ – Czech Republic 
DK - Denmark
EG - Egypt
FI - Finland
FR - France
DE - Germany
GR - Greece
IL - Israel
IT – Italy
JP - Japan
LU - Luxembourg
NL - Netherlands
NO – Norway
PL - Poland
PT – Portugal
SI - Slovenia
ES - Spain
SE - Sweden
CH - Switzerland
TR - Turkey
GB - United Kingdom

If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) = "QA" enter a Qualifying Country (EXCEPT CANADA and AUSTRALIA) End Product.
Valid Codes:
AT - Austria
BE – Belgium
CZ – Czech Republic 
DK - Denmark
EG - Egypt
FI - Finland
FR - France
DE - Germany
GR - Greece
IL - Israel
IT – Italy
JP - Japan
LU - Luxembourg
NL - Netherlands
NO – Norway
PL - Poland
PT – Portugal
SI - Slovenia
ES - Spain
SE - Sweden
CH - Switzerland
TR - Turkey
GB - United Kingdom


If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) = "QE" enter a Qualifying Country (EXCEPT CANADA) End Product.
Valid Codes:
AU - Australia
AT - Austria
BE – Belgium
CZ – Czech Republic 
DA - Denmark
EG - Egypt
FI - Finland
FR - France
DE - Germany
GR - Greece
IL - Israel
IT – Italy
JP - Japan
LU - Luxembourg
NL - Netherlands
NO – Norway
PL - Poland
PT – Portugal
SI - Slovenia
ES - Spain
SE - Sweden
CH - Switzerland
TR - Turkey
GB - United Kingdom

If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) equals "C", enter a Free Trade Agreements Country End Product.
Valid Code:
CA - Canada

If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) equals "N", enter a Free Trade Agreements Country End Product
Valid Codes:
AU - Australia
CA – Canada
CL – Chile
CO – Columbia
CR – Costa Rica
DO – Dominican Republic
SV – El Salvador
GT – Guatemala
HN – Honduras
KR – Korea, Republic of
MX - Mexico 
NI - Nicaragua
SG - Singapore 

If Buy American/Free Trade Agreements End Product (70) equals "P", enter a Free Trade Agreements Country End Product
Valid Codes:
AU - Australia
CA – Canada
CL – Chile
CO – Columbia
CR – Costa Rica
DO – Dominican Republic
SV – El Salvador
GT – Guatemala
HN – Honduras
MX - Mexico 
NI - Nicaragua
SG - Singapore 
	Blank 

	73 
	Product 
	Duty Free Entry Requested 
	1 
	C 
	Duty Free Entry Requested ( Not available for Supplies Acquired for use Outside the United States ) 
	If Buy American Indicator (68) = "I" must be blank.

Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes 
	N 

	74 
	Product 
	Duty Free Entry Requested/Foreign Supplies in US Code 
	1 
	C 
	Are such foreign supplies now in the United States? 
	If Buy American Indicator (68) = "I" must be blank. Applies only if Duty Free Entry Requested (73) = "Y"

Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes 
	Blank 

	75 
	Product 
	Duty Free Entry Requested/Duty Paid Code 
	1 
	C 
	Has the duty on such foreign supplies been paid? 
	If Buy American Indicator (68) = "I" must be blank.
Applies only if Duty Free Entry Requested/Foreign Supplies in US Code (74) = "Y".

Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes 
	Blank 

	76 
	Product 
	Duty Free Entry Requested/Duty Paid Amount 
	15 
	C 
	What amount is included in the offer to cover such duty? 
	If Buy American Indicator (68) = "I" must be blank.
Applies only if Duty Free Entry Requested/Duty Paid Code (75) = "N" 
	Blank 

	77 
	Product 
	Price Breaks Solicited Indicator 
	1 
	C 
	  
	Must Match RFQ Requirement.
Applies only when price break ranges are solicited.

Valid Codes:
Y - Quantity Price Breaks Solicited
N - Not Solicited 
	RFQ Requirement 

	78 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 1 Lower Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	79 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 1 Upper Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	80 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 1 Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999.99999 
	Blank 

	81 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 2 Lower Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999

Quantity price breaks must be stepladder (upper quantity + 1 for next lower quantity) 
	RFQ Requirement 

	82 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 2 Upper Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	83 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 2 Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999.99999

Quantity price breaks must be stepladder (upper quantity + 1 for next lower quantity) 
	Blank 

	84 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 3 Lower Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999

Quantity price breaks must be stepladder (upper quantity + 1 for next lower quantity) 
	RFQ Requirement 

	85 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 3 Upper Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	86 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 3 Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999.99999 
	Blank 

	87 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 4 Lower Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999

Quantity price breaks must be stepladder (upper quantity + 1 for next lower quantity) 
	RFQ Requirement 

	88 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 4 Upper Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	89 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 4 Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999.99999 
	Blank 

	90 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 5 Lower Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999

Quantity price breaks must be stepladder (upper quantity + 1 for next lower quantity) 
	RFQ Requirement 

	91 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 5 Upper Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	92 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 5 Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999.99999 
	Blank 

	93 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 6 Lower Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999

Quantity price breaks must be stepladder (upper quantity + 1 for next lower quantity) 
	RFQ Requirement 

	94 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 6 Upper Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	RFQ Requirement 

	95 
	Product 
	Quantity Price Breaks - Range 6 Unit Price 
	13 
	C 
	If greater quantities are available at the same or yet lower unit prices, offerors are requested to enter the lower unit prices and quantity ranges to which such prices will apply. The Government may elect to accept such alternate quantity quotations not exceeding $25,000 without further solicitation or discussion. See DLAD 52.213-9000 Quantity break. 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F" or "P" then enter a value.
Format 0 ~ 9999999.99999 
	Blank 

	96 
	Product 
	Quantity Variance Plus 
	2 
	C 
	Use when quoting a variation in the quantity of items to be delivered under any resulting order. 
	Range of 0 - 10
If Solicitation Type Indicator (2) does not equal A, F, or P, Bid Type Code (24) is not affected.

If Solicitation Type Indicator (2) = A, F, or P, and percent quoted is greater than the increase permitted by the RFQ, then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB".

If batch file has a value, then must upload a value. 
	0 

	97 
	Product 
	Quantity Variance Minus 
	2 
	C 
	Use when quoting a variation in the quantity of items to be delivered under any resulting order. 
	Range of 0 - 10
If Solicitation Type Indicator (2) does not equal A, F, or P, Bid Type Code (24) is not affected.

If Solicitation Type Indicator (2) = A, F, or P, and percent quoted is greater than the decrease permitted by the RFQ, then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB" .


If batch file has a value, then must upload a value. 
	0 

	98 
	Product 
	Minimum Order Quantity Code 
	1 
	C 
	Is a larger quantity obtainable at no additional total price due to a minimum order quantity?

Associated with an NSN or Part Number 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F", "P", or blank then must be completed.
Valid Codes:
Y - Yes
N - No 
	N 

	99 
	Product 
	Minimum Order Maximum Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	Provide quantity that is available at no additional total price due to a minimum order quantity. 
	If Minimum Order Quantity Code (98) equals "Y", then must be completed.

Format 0 ~ 9999999999 
	Blank 

	100 
	Product 
	Immediate Shipment Available 
	1 
	O 
	Is there a quantity available for immediate shipment? 
	If Solicitation Type (2) = "A", "F", "P", or blank then must be completed.
Valid Codes:
N - No
Y - Yes 
	N 

	101 
	Product 
	Immediate Shipment Quantity 
	10 
	C 
	Provide quantity of the item that is available for immediate shipment. 
	If Immediate Shipment Available (100) equals "N", then must be blank.

If Immediate Shipment Available (100) equals "Y", then cannot be blank.
Format 0 ~ 0 ~ 9999999999. 
	Blank 

	102 
	Product 
	Manufacturer/Dealer 
	2 
	M 
	Status of "Quoting For" CAGE code. 
	Valid Codes:
DD - Dealer
MM - Manufacturer
QD - Qualified Supplier List Dealer
QM - Qualified Supplier List Manufacturer 
	Blank 

	103 
	Product 
	Actual Manufacturing/Production Source CAGE code 
	5 
	M 
	If Manufacturer/Dealer (102) is "dealer" or "qualified supplier list dealer", enter CAGE code of facility that is actually manufacturing/producing the item. If the CAGE code is unknown, or the facility does not have a CAGE code, enter the company name and address in Actual Manufacturing/Production Source CAGE Remarks (104). 
	If Manufacturer/Dealer (102) = MM or QM must be blank.

If Manufacturer/Dealer (102) = DD or QD and Actual Manufacturing/Production Source Name and Address (104) is blank, then must be completed. 
	Blank 

	104 
	Product 
	Actual Manufacturing/Production Source Name and Address 
	255 
	C 
	If Manufacturer/Dealer (102) is "dealer" or "qualified supplier list dealer" and the CAGE code of the actual manufacturing/production source is unknown, or the facility does not have a CAGE code, enter the company name and address. 
	If Manufacturer/Dealer (102) = MM or QM must be blank.

If Manufacturer/Dealer (102) = DD or QD and Actual Manufacturing/Production Source CAGE (103) is blank, then must be completed. 
	Blank 

	105 
	Product 
	Item Description Indicator 
	1 
	M 
	Describes controlling characteristics of the item.
Valid Codes:
B - Source Controlled Item
D - Specification/Standard/Drawing Item
N - Non-NSN Item
P - Approved Source Item
Q - Qualified Products List (QPL) Item
S - Service Material Item
	Must Match RFQ Requirement. 
	RFQ Requirement 

	106 
	Product 
	Part Number Offered Code 
	1 
	C 
	  
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "P", "B", or "N", then must be blank.

If Item Description Indicator (105) equals "P", "B", or "N", then must be completed.

Valid Codes Where Item Description Indicator (105) equals "P" or "N":
1 - Exact Product
2 - Alternate Product
3 - Superseding P/N - Administrative P/N Change Only
4 - Superseding P/N - Minor Change / No Change in Configuration
5 - Previously Approved Product
6 - CAGE & P/N Correction - CAGE code in Error/Same Corp., Different Division
7 - CAGE & P/N Correction - CAGE code in Error/Sold to Different Corp.
8 - CAGE & P/N Correction - Part Number not Recognized
9 - CAGE & P/N Correction - Obsolete Part Number
A - CAGE & P/N Correction - Other

Valid Codes Where Item Description Indicator (105) equals "B":
1 - Exact Product
2 - Alternate Product

If "1" Exact Product is selected, columns 107 ~ 108 must match approved item listed on the RFQ.

If "2" Alternate Product is selected, complete columns 107 ~ 108, Bid Type Code (24) must equal "AB" Alternate Bid.


If "3, 4, or 5" Superceding P/N/Previously Approved Product is selected, complete columns 107 ~ 108 . Bid Type is not affected.

If "6, 7, 8, 9, or A" CAGE & P/N Correction is selected, complete columns 107 ~ 108. Bid Type is not affected. 
	Blank 

	107 
	Product 
	Part Number Offered CAGE code 
	5 
	C 
	  
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "P", "B", or "N", then must be blank.

If Item Description Indicator (105) equals "P", "B", or "N", then must be completed.

If Part Number Offered Code (106) = "1" Exact Product, CAGE & Part Number must match approved CAGE/part numbers listed on the RFQ. 
	Blank 

	108 
	Product 
	Part Number Offered - Part Number 
	40
	C 
	  
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "P", "B", or "N", then must be blank.

If Item Description Indicator (105) equals "P", "B", or "N", then must be completed.

If Part Number Offered Code (106) equals"1" Exact Product, CAGE & Part Number must match approved CAGE/part numbers listed on the RFQ. 
	Blank 

	109 
	Product 
	Part Number Offered Remarks 
	255 
	O 
	Used to provide remarks about part number offered. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "P", "B", or "N", or Part Number Offered Code (106) equals "1", then must be blank.

Applies if Item Description Indicator (105) equals "P", "B", or "N", and Part Number Offered Code (106) does not equal "1". 
	Blank 

	110 
	Product 
	Supplies Offered 
	1 
	C 
	Identifies supplies offered when the controlling characteristic of the item is a Specification/Standard/Drawing. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "D", "B" or "Q" then must be blank.

If Item Description Indicator (105) equals "D", "B" or "Q" must be completed.

Valid Codes:
1 - Supplies in accordance with all Specification/Standard/Drawings cited in the solicitation Item Description.
2 - Supplies based on a different revision of any Specification/Standard/Drawings cited in the solicitation Item Description.
3 - Supplies based on changes to the Specification/Standard/Drawings.
4 - Supplies based on other technical data, or item description in error. 
	Blank 

	111 
	Product 
	Supplies Offered Remarks 
	255 
	O 
	  
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "D", "B", or "Q" or Supplies Offered Code (110) equals "1", then must be blank.

Applies if Item Description Indicator (105) equals "D", "B", or "Q" and Supplies Offered Code (110) does not equal "1." 
	Blank 

	112 
	Product 
	Qualification Requirements MFG CAGE 
	5 
	C 
	Provide Manufacturer CAGE of offered item as prescribed by FAR 52.209 - 1. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "Q", then must be blank.

If Item Description Indicator (105) equals "Q", then must be completed. 
	Blank 

	113 
	Product 
	Qualification Requirements Source CAGE 
	5 
	C 
	Provide Source CAGE of offered item as prescribed by FAR 52.209 - 1. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "Q", then must be blank.

Applies if Item Description Indicator (105) equals "Q". 
	Blank 

	114 
	Product 
	Qualification Requirements Item Name 
	50 
	C 
	Provide the Item Name as prescribed by FAR 52.209 - 1. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "Q", then must be blank.

Applies if Item Description Indicator (105) equals "Q". 
	Blank 

	115 
	Product 
	Qualification Requirements Service Identification 
	50 
	C 
	Provide the Service Identification as prescribed by FAR 52.209 - 1. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "Q", then must be blank.

Applies if Item Description Indicator (105) equals "Q". 
	Blank 

	116 
	Product 
	Qualification Requirements Test Number 
	59 
	C 
	Provide the Test Number as prescribed by FAR 52.209 - 1. 
	If Item Description Indicator (105) does not equal "Q", then must be blank.

Applies if Item Description Indicator (105) equals "Q". 
	Blank 

	117 
	Product 
	Higher-Level Quality Indicator 
	1 
	M 
	Identifies when a Higher-Level quality standard/system is required for the item. (FAR 46.202 - 4) 
	Must match RFQ Requirement.
Valid Codes
N - Not Applicable
7 - ISO 9001:2000
6 - ISO 9001:2000 tailored 
	RFQ Requirement 

	118 
	Product 
	Higher-Level Quality Code 
	1 
	C 
	Identify the Higher-Level quality standard/system that applies to the manufacturing facility. 
	If Higher Level Quality Indicator (117) equals 'N' then must be blank

If Higher-Level Quality Indicator (117) does not equal "N" must be completed.

If Higher-Level Quality Indicator (117) equals '7'
Valid Codes:
7 - ISO 9001:2000
2 - Other Equivalent
1 - None

If Higher-Level Quality Indicator (117) equals '6'
Valid Codes:
7 - ISO 9001:2000
6 - ISO 9001:2000 tailored
2 - Other Equivalent
1 - None

If Higher-Level Quality Indicator (117) equals "6" or "7" and Higher-Level Quality Code (118) equals "1", then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB".
	Blank 

	119 
	Product 
	Higher-Level Quality Remarks 
	255 
	O 
	  
	If Higher Level Quality Indicator (117) = "N", must be blank.

If Higher-Level Quality Indicator (117) does not equal "N" and Higher Level Quality Code (118) does not equal "2" (Other) must be blank.

If Higher-Level Quality Indicator (117) does not equal N and Higher Level Quality Code (118) = 2 (Other) must be completed. 
	Blank 

	120 
	Product 
	Child Labor Certification Code 
	1 
	M 
	Are you providing an end product that may have been mined, produced or manufactured by forced or indentured child labor? (See FAR 52.222-18 and the Department of Labor's current list of products and corresponding countries at http://www.dol.gov/ILAB/regs/eo13126/) 
	Valid Codes:
N - No
U - May supply, but not aware of any such use of child labor based on good faith effort
Y - Yes

If Child Labor Certification Code (120) = "Y", then Bid Type Code (24) must be Bid With Exception, "BW" or Alternate Bid, "AB".
	N 

	121 
	Header 
	Quote Remarks 
	255 
	O 
	Available for all quotes except when Bid Type Code (24) equals "BI" (Bid Without Exception) on solicitations with a "T" or "U" in the ninth position. These quotes are eligible for automated awards and the evaluation program cannot consider textual input. 
	If Solicitation Type Indicator (2) = A, F, or P and Bid Type Code (24) equals "BI" (Bid without Exception), must be blank. 
	Blank 
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